

Cancellation Request sent by Equability Finance to We Trust LLC on 04/13/2022


---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Accounts Equibility Finance <accounts@equibilityfinance.com>
Date: Mon, Apr 18, 2022 at 7:19 PM
Subject: Important Message
To: PavanKumar Nammi <pavannammi@gmail.com>


Hi Pawan
Please find the requested information of cancellation email on dated 04/13/ 2022.

Dear We Trust LLC
This is to bring your attention that Mr. Pawan Kumar Nammi Loan number 139102 is the existing customer in your company and as per the terms and condition Mr. Pawan Kumar Nammi has came up with all the requirement of your company still his file is on hold. we request you to cancel the file and refund the total amount of $38,978.50 into the bank account of Mr. Pawan Kumar Nammi.
Thank you
Regards
Compliance Department


We Trust LLC response to Equibility Finance on 04/18/2022

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Accounts Equibility Finance <accounts@equibilityfinance.com>
Date: Mon, Apr 18, 2022 at 7:23 PM
Subject: Important Message
To: PavanKumar Nammi <pavannammi@gmail.com>


Hi Pawan
Please find the requested information of the email that we have received from We Trust LLC on 04/18/2022.

Dear Equibility Finance US LLC
( Compliance Department )
We would like to inform you that as per your request we review the file number 139102. and as per your request we have almost completed the investigation of the file and come up with the conclusion that we will close the account of Mr. Pawan Kumar Nammi by tomorrow it self. We do apologies for the delay we request you to be with us and don't cancel all the contracts with our company.
   
Thank You

Regards
We Trust LLC


